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Ashbourne Beer Festival 
The Victorian splendour of Ashbourne Town Hall, opposite the Market 

Place, is the setting for the first Ashbourne and District CAMRA beer 

festival between Friday, 22
nd

 and Sunday, 24
th

 March. The sub-branch 

was founded only twelve months ago, therefore it’s a considerable 

achievement to organize a festival so quickly. There will be 

approximately 25 real ales with the emphasis on local provenance i.e. 

mostly sourced from within a 30 mile radius of Ashbourne, with the 

strongest being Ripley brewed Amber Imperial IPA, 6.5% abv. Wales is 

likely to be represented by Brecon brewery, though this has to be 

confirmed. Traditional cider and perry lovers are catered for with 7 

varieties, and proceedings will be enlivened by Bill Bailey’s Jazz Band 

and Murphy’s Marbles, together with some local musicians. Third pint 

measures may be consumed and children are welcome, accompanied by 

adults, with the proviso that children leave by 6pm. The festival, where 

beer will be bought with tokens, not cash, is open from 1pm, Friday to 

11pm. On Saturday, noon to 11pm, and Sunday (subject to beer 

supplies) noon to 3pm. Admission is £2 at all times but free to card 

carrying CAMRA members, and should you wish to work at the 

festival please contact Mark Grist m.grist2@sky.com A decent bus 

service exists between Derby and Ashbourne.  
 

Roundhouse Festival Still on the Right Track 
The 3

rd
 Roundhouse festival was well received by 9,000 or so punters 

with a good selection of brews still available on Saturday evening. 

Grainstore brewery of Oakham was top of the hops with a remarkable 

hat-trick of victories in the judging of East Midlands’ beers. 

Grainstore’s winners and Bateman’s Salem Porter which topped the 

Porter category are now in the running for the Champion Winter Beer 

of Britain final 2014. Grainstore Nip was judged the best in the Barley 

Wine/Strong Ale section whilst Grainstore Rutland Beast was best in 

the Old Ale/Strong Mild category. Overall winner was Grainstore 

Ratliffe Stout, 4.3% abv, which is very similar to Dancing Duck’s 

superb Dark Drake. 135 new members were recruited, almost certainly 

a record for the winter festival, and comparable in number to the City 

Charter Festivals. A monumental effort was required to stage this 

rapidly expanding event and all of the many volunteers deserve a huge 

pat on the back. There is a festival review meeting at the Brunswick 

function room on Tuesday, 19
th

 March, starting at 8pm, and a cracking 

brewery visit for festival volunteers is detailed on page 4. 
 

Could You be Winter Fest Chairman? 

From 2014 to 2016 Derby CAMRA will host the prestigious National 

Winter Ales Festival at the Roundhouse. Should you wish to stand for 

the exacting, but rewarding, voluntary role of Festival Chairman, please 

contact the Branch Secretary, Ian Forman, 

secretary@derbycamra.org.uk before Monday, 8
th

 April. 

 

 
 

 
 
 
 

Derby CAMRA Branch 
Meeting, Pattenmakers,  
Wednesday, 13th March 

The Pattenmakers, Crown Street, Duffield, 
will host this month’s branch meeting, 
starting at 8pm on Wednesday, 13

th
 

March. For a group Zig Zag ticket, meet 
at Derby bus station, bay 22, at 730pm for 
the 735pm sixes departure. Further 
information from the Branch Secretary, 

Ian Forman, on 01332 882996 or email 

secretary@derbycamra.org.uk 
 

Branch AGMs 
Notice is hereby given that the Derby 
CAMRA AGM will be held at the 
Flowerpot, King Street, Derby, on 
Thursday, 11

th
 April at 8pm. CAMRA 

members may stand for any committee 
position they wish, so long as they have a 
proposer and seconder, both of whom 

must also be members. Please bring your 
membership card in order to vote. For 
more information contact Branch 

Secretary, Ian Forman 
secretary@derbycamra.org.uk The 
Ashbourne CAMRA AGM is on 30th April 
at the Shire Horse, Wyaston, starting 8pm. 
 

City Charter Festival 
The summer City Charter Beer Festival 
between 10th and 14th July will 
commemorate the life of former Derby 
citizen John Whitehurst FRS, an eminent 
clock maker and scientist who was born 
300 years ago this year. We will be 
teaming up with the Derby Museum and 

the Tourist Information Centre to celebrate 
his life, which will provide excellent 
publicity for the festival. We are quietly 
confident this year we will bring a breath 
of fresh air into the festival with a large 
marquee outside complementing the usual 
Darwin suite and foyer areas.  We are 
hoping to include an additional outside 
area, weather permitting. The next 

planning meetings for this summer’s 
festival are: Wednesday, 6thMarch at the 
Exeter Arms, and Wednesday, 3

rd
 April 

at the Dolphin. Both meetings start at 8pm. 
Please contact Russell Gilbert 
russgilbert@o2.co.uk for further 
information. A Publicity Officer is still 
required and if you’re interested in filling 

this important role, which largely dictates 
festival attendance, please contact Julian 
Tubbs tubbspubs@gmail.com 
 

National Pub of the Year 
Baum, Toad Lane, Rochdale, has been 
named CAMRA Pub of the Year for 2013.

Mild  &  Bitter 
Keeping Derby CAMRA drinkers informed since 1975 

mailto:secretary@derbycamra.org.uk
mailto:secretary@derbycamra.org.uk
mailto:secretary@derbycamra.org.uk
mailto:russgilbert@o2.co.uk
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Derby Pubs Map/What Pub 
Derby CAMRA requires pub photos for 
the What Pub website and for a new Derby 
pub map that we are designing. If you 
have any current pub photos from the list 
below or are able to take any please e-mail 
them to photos@derbycamra.org.uk 
 

Abbey, Bedford, Blue Jay, Blue Peter, 
Bonnie Prince, Brackens, Brick & Tile, 
Bridge Inn, Broadway, Coach & Horses, 
Corner Pin, Crescent, Duke of Clarence,  

Falstaff, Five Lamps, Garden City, Golden 
Pheasant, Greyhound, Horse & Groom, 
Jonty Farmer, Junction, Kensington, 
Kingfisher, Kings Corner, King's 
Highway, Lawns, Little Chester Ale 
House, Malt Shovel, Markeaton, Master 
Locksmith, Maypole, Mile, Moon, Mr 
Grundy's, New Bridge Inn, New Zealand,  

Norman Arms, No 5, Oaklands, Peacock, 
Peregrine, Pitcher & Piano, Portland, 
Prince of Wales, Red Cow, Rose & 
Crown, Seven Stars, Smithfield, Stenson 
Fields, Tavern, Toby Carvery, Traveller's 
Rest, Vernon Arms, Waggon & Horses,  
White Horse, White Swan (Littleover), 
White Swan (Spondon) Windmill, 

Woodlands, Woodlark. 
 

GBG Pubs’ Beer Festivals 
Two of our Good Beer Guide listed pubs, 
The Bell, Smalley, and the Pattenmakers, 
Duffield, both have beer festivals on over 
the Easter weekend. 
 

 

Chester Green Real Ale 
Trail 

The licensees of six pubs in the Chester 
Green area have collaborated to produce a 
scheme whereby the consumption of 3 

different real ales (over a period of time) is 
rewarded with a free, made to measure, 
Real Ale Challenge T shirt. Participating 
pubs are: Bridge Inn, Duke of Clarence, 
Little Chester Ale House, Furnace, 
Peacock, and the Coach and Horses. 
 

Goodbye Graham 
This month sees the retirement of Graham 
Yates who has been the brewer and 
licensee of the Brunswick since Everard’s 
bought the railway pub in 2002. Graham 

has succeeded in maintaining the high 
standards set by his predecessor, Trevor 
Harris, and the annual October beer 
festival has been a highlight of the busy 
festival roster. We wish Graham well in 
his retirement and may the fish he catches 
be big ones. See page 4 for presentation. 
 

More Discounted Ale 
J D Wetherspoon, the Watford based pub 
company, is offering 20p discount per pint 

of real ale to card carrying CAMRA 
members. This is separate from, and not in 
addition to, the 50p members’ tokens. 
 

AGM Registration 
You have until March 22nd to pre-register 
for the national CAMRA AGM in 
Norwich, go to www.camra.org.uk It’s 
hard to imagine a better city in which to 
have a CAMRA AGM. More details are in 
What’s Brewing and Derby Drinker. 

 

Award for Smithy 
The Smithfield, Meadow Road, has 
received formal recognition from Derby 
Civic Society for its comprehensive 
restoration. Built in 1840, the Smithy is 
now sound for the next 60 years or so 
thanks to owner Paul Clark, and this was 
recognised in the George Larkin Brighter 
City of Derby awards. 
 

Fond Farewell to Branch 
Stalwarts 

Stewart and Susan Lawson have left 
industrial Derby for pastures new in rural 
North Wales. They are taking on the Ffarm 
Country House B&B at Betws-yn-Rhos, 
‘phone no. 01492 680448 and would be 
pleased to see any of their many Derby 
CAMRA friends. With the fantastic 

National Inventory listed Albion Ale 
House in Conwy not too far away, the 
invitation looks tempting. Derby CAMRA 
thanks Stewart and Susan for their sterling 
work over many years as 
Secretary/Treasurer/Auditors of branch 
and beer festivals. 
 

Marchington Melee 1 
Paul Needham, formerly of the 
Wherehouse, Friar Gate, Derby, and more 

recently, the Good Beer Guide listed 
Unicorn, Newton Solney, invites you to 
the village hall, The Square, Marchington, 
on Friday, 8th and Saturday, 9th March, 
when he’s staging a beer festival. 20 real 
ales and bands will feature. It opens 5pm 
Friday and 3pm Saturday. Paul also runs 
the Dog and Partridge in the Staffordshire 
village near Uttoxeter. 
 

Annual Beer Census 
Thanks to all of you who turned out on 1st 

February to collate the information which 
confirmed Derby’s status amongst the 
nation’s top beer destinations. All in all, 
276 beers were recorded, of which 180 
were different (176 last year), available in 
68 pubs with an average price £2.87 a pint. 
 

NBSS (National Beer 
Scoring Scheme) 

Stewart Marshall, Derby CAMRA GBG 

Coordinator, would like to draw your 
attention to some information regarding 

beerscoring .org.uk 

The Scores 
The bottom end of the scoring range has 
changed recently to differentiate between 
‘no real ale’ and ‘undrinkable’: 
0.0 – no real ale 

0.5 – undrinkable 
1.0 – poor 
2.0 – average 
3.0 – good 
4.0 – very good 
5.0 - perfect 
* - half points allowed 

Undrinkable 

Before scoring your beer as ‘undrinkable’, 
always ask for a replacement and score 
that.  If no replacement is offered then 
score 0.5 

Perfect 

We all need to calibrate our scoring to the 
same level so that scores can be compared. 
The primary factor in scoring is beer 
quality, not whether we like the style of 
beer. The most important point on the 
scale is 2.0 – ‘average’, ordinary run of the 
mill beer quality. All beers should be 

judged against this standard:  get this level 
right and the other scores should fall into 
place. Unfortunately, the prominence of 
5.0 – ‘perfect’ is starting to become more 
common. A score of 5.0 should be 
awarded rarely. If you do find yourself 
doing it, stop and pinch yourself to check 
to see whether you have died and gone to 

heaven. Some seasoned beer scorers have 
never scored a 5.0. 

Finding Bass 
Some have reported difficulty in finding 
Bass in the beer scoring system. Just type 
‘dr’ into the brewery field and Draught 
Bass will appear in the list. 

Finding the Brewery Tap 

Another scoring difficulty is finding the 
Brewery Tap. Just type ‘brewery tap –‘ 
(brewery tap<space><hyphen>) into the 
pub field and it will appear in the list. 

Beer Not Found 
Virtually every brewery is in the beer 
scoring system but not every beer. If your 
beer is not in the list, choose ‘—other—‘ 

and enter your beer name in the comment 
field. 
 

CAMRA Launch What Pub 
CAMRA has launched a new, national pub 
site which you can review and update 
yourself. Visit whatpub.com and log in 
with either the same details you use to visit 
the members’ area of CAMRA’s national 
website or, if you have not visited the 
Members’ area of CAMRA’s national 
website before, try your CAMRA 

membership number and postcode when 
you joined the campaign (upper case, no 
space). 
 

Mild & Bitter on the Web 
Mild & Bitter is now available to view in 
the Members’ Area of the award winning 
Derby Branch Website as well as a 
number of back copies in case you have 
mislaid previous editions. You will now  
have a choice to follow the link in the 

reminder e-mail straight to the Members 
Area or download the attachment.  
 

Minutes of the Branch 
Meeting held at the Thomas 

Leaper on 13th February  
Apologies. Ian Forman, Konrad Machej, 
Steve Crispin. Minutes of last meeting. 
Approved. Matters Arising. None. 

OFFICERS’ reports. Chair. Firstly the 
sad news of the death of two Branch 
Stalwarts, Mick Chambers and Keith 
Normington. Mick was a regular worker at 
both Beer Festivals were he would often 
steward, while Keith had held many posts 
within the Branch inc Branch & Beer 
Festival Treasurer, Branch Auditor and he 

also worked at almost every Beer Festival 
that the Branch had run. He was a member 
from the very early days of the Branch. 

http://www.camra.org.uk/
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Both Tim Williams and Jok Arguile spoke 
about Keith’s contribution to the Branch. 
It was noted that he had run raffles that 
sustained the branch financially in the 
early days, and had been the lifeblood of 
the Branch. Nationally we had just had the 
National Winter Ales Fest which comes to 

Derby next year. The Members’ weekend 
in Norwich is 19th-21st April, pre-
registration is open. The Branch has tabled 
a motion for consideration about the recent 
interference in the Winter-Fest budget. 
Community pubs month is in April. We 
are being advised to keep up the pressure 
on our local MP’s about the duty escalator 

ahead of the budget. Locally the Derby 
Winter-Fest is only a week away. The 
ABC crawl was held at the start of the 
month with approx 180 different ales, up 
on last year. Our Pubs of the Year have 
been selected and thanks go to the 17 
Judges that took part this year. 
Presentations will take place at the Winter-

Fest. Our own AGM is on 11th April, any 
volunteers for the Committee to let the 
Secretary know before the AGM. There 
were still a few Branch vacancies as per 
M&B. Secretary. Not present. Treasurer.  
Accounts should be ready for next 
Committee Meeting. Derby Drinker Ads-
monies still need to be reined in. Summer 

Festival. Budget approval detained until 
audit is complete. Theme is John 
Whitehurst - Festival of time. We are 
getting good support from Assembly 
Rooms, who are applying for a licence. 
Computer image of proposed marquee 
available from Russell. Changes of 
catering, Kudos taken over by Assembly 
Rooms. Great Hall, dressing rooms and 

behind stage not available. Entertainment 
on main stage transfers to marquee. Fire 
limit similar. Main entrance is opposite 
quad. Advance bookings probably enter 
via Darwin. Campaigning. Mild Month - 
Steve Crispin contacting licensees at trade 
session, plus AV participation. Pub map - 
Next M&B will contain a list of pub 

photos that are still required. Out of town 
surveys - A modest improvement but 
something to build on. Derby Drinker. 

Thanks to Terry Morton for early 
distribution of DDs in town. Late arrival of 
Festival material and Steve Webster’s last 
DD contributed to lateness, ie issue was 
released near to Festival date. Future of 

DD – we have had some response from the 
Ad in DD for a new designer. The Printers 
turnaround was much better with 2nd new 
printer based in Wiltshire, and much 
cheaper than Colourstream. Good Beer 

Guide & Surveys. GBG selections made-
see Stewart for details. NBSS - going to 
old site will allow edit of old scores. 

Stewart will assist with problems that 
include finding obscure pubs and brewery 
taps. No info on survey trips. Stewart will 
review Mild+Bitter entries. 
Locale+CAMRA discount. Both schemes 
going well. Membership. Konrad reported 
the following regarding membership: 34 
new members, 2 transferred into Branch, 
1 transferred out of Branch. There are no 

reports of lapsed members this month. 
 This is because HQ is cleaning the records 
- getting rid of duplicates, out-of-date 
information, etc.  Lapsed members records 
have to be extracted from this, and so will 
be reported next month. Konrad intends 
to write to new and transferred-in 

members towards the end of the month. 
Our total membership stands at 2184, of 
which 45 are under-26.  These figures do 
not include Ashbourne & District. 
 Nationally, we are 25 short of 147,000 
members - so recruit a mate today! Mild + 

Bitter.  Deadline is Wed 27 Feb. ABC 
info requested by that date. Regional.  

Branch reports have been requested for 
next meeting on 2 March. Sub Branch. 
Ashbourne Beer Festival is publicized in 
M&B and DD. Festival is in Town Hall. 
Poty is Smiths Tavern and Country Poty is 
Sycamore, Parwich. Amber Valley are 
moving their Festival to Alfreton Leisure 
Centre promising line up of bands. Info is 

on web site. Socials. As per M&B. Dean 
reported 26 March Old Spa. Possibly 
Brunswick Feb 26. 9 Mar. Burton dancing 
Festival. Meet Burton 12pm Devonshire. 
Beer Festival coming up - Burton  
Loughborough, Leics/Ashbourne. Pub 

info. International Festival of beer is on at 
National Brew Centre. Organized for 

major brewers. Launch of National 
Brewing Heritage Trust. Beaconsfield for 
sale. Wifi cloud is being installed in pubs 
by e.g. Coors. Coors Franciscan wells 
brewery purchase. Portland Hotel closed. 
Castle and Falcon to reopen ? Robin 
reopened with real ale, licensee from 
Sheffield area. Change of lic Honeycomb. 
Graham Yates - concern over fate of 

brewery as he retires end March. Suggest 
recognition of Graham on retirement. His 
non CAMRA leaving event march 30. 
Winter Festival. (Gill apologized for late 
arrival). T shirts - volunteers t shirt 
guaranteed if staff form filled in. They are 
purple. Sale t shirts based on gbg pubs in 
for 2 years. 8 pubs are in. Bab has taken10 

in advance. Shirts on sale at the meeting. 
Well thought out continental list. Wizard 
cider from staffs. Cider training. 600 hard 
copy trade tickets plus soft invites have 
been sent out, plus breweries can bring 4 if 
on list. Jim Suter reported 340 beers 140 
breweries. EM judging 12.30 mix of 
judges. Plenty of media and craft beer and 

guild writers as judges. Main focus Derby 
City,  plus Derbyshire ales, plus tickers’ 
beers, competition beers etc. Signage - 
Washing line over stillages inc beer 
mileage info on cask ends. Style info on 
cask ends, 5 colours. Staffing shortage 
highest on Wednesday. Food available on 
Saturday setup. Also Monday take down. 

Sunday take down food at Smithfield. 
Washup 19 March Brunswick. Festival 
Workers event…Dancing Duck tour and 
drinks in New Zealand 26th April. Festival 
set-up starts Friday 2pm. Fri - 9 and 
Saturday morning cooling training. 40 
coolers being sent from HQ. Tokens £1.00 
on stalls and outside festival where 
permitted. 2 food vouchers for full day. 

Ads will be in Telegraph. Beer supply 
policy, one in ten beers held back for 24 
hours. All 18s will be on from the 
beginning. AOB. A suggestion was made 
for an under 30 social with two free pints 
for under 30s. The suggestion was made 
with a view to the long term sustainability 

of Derby branch. Brian Foxon has died, 
mass in cathedral on 26th, funeral 27th. 
Proposed motion for National AGM: This 
conference rebukes the national executive 
for its failure to implement current policies 
relating to beer festivals according to the 
letter of the internal policy document in 
particular and instructs it to do so in 

future. 

 

Amber Valley 
CAMRA 

 

Breaking Rocks Headline at 
Hunter Arms 

In the midst of a busy Easter weekend with 
several beer festivals, the Hunter Arms, 
Kilburn, has the Breaking Rocks band live 
on the Saturday night. There will be eight 
real ales to choose from plus traditional 
cider.   

Forthcoming Beer Festivals 
 Grapes, High Street, Belper, 14th to 17th 
March. 

 Cross Keys, Market Place, Belper, 22nd to 
24th March. 
Holly Bush, Makeney, 28th to 30th March. 
New Inn, Riddings, 29th March to 1st 
April. 
Strutt Club, Campbell Street, Belper, 5th 
to 7th April. 
 

Inn Brief 
Pub People Company reopened the 
Steampacket, Swanwick, on 1st March, and 
we understand that up to 6 real ales will be 

dispensed in the former Shipstone’s house. 
Jamie and Amie are the new licensees of 
the Hop Inn, Openwoodgate.   

Ashbourne CAMRA 
Minutes of the Ashbourne 
& District CAMRA Sub-
branch meeting at The 
Cock, Clifton, on 26th 

February  
In attendance: 10 members, including 
Konrad Machej from Derby branch. 

Apologies:  4 members, including 
secretary. Minutes of last meeting: Not 

 

Derby Branch Meeting 

Agenda 
1. Apologies. 2. Minutes of last meeting. 3. 

Matters arising. 4. Officers’ reports – Chair, 

Secretary, Treasurer. 5. Other reports – Beer 

Festivals, Campaigning, Derby Drinker, 

Good Beer Guide & Surveys, LocAle, 

Membership, Mild & Bitter, Pubs Officer & 

Pub Preservation, Publications, Regional, 

Sales, Socials, Sub-Branches, Tasting Panel, 

Transport, Website. 6. Information exchange 

– Pub, Brewery, etc 7. Any other business.  
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typed up for Jan, will be done by 
Chairman and circulated with Feb minutes 
Chairman: Reminded all of the 
Marchington Beer Festival March 8-9. 
Contact had been made with Dancing 
Duck brewery who agreed to a branch visit 
as part of the thank-you offered to festival 

workers. This will be in late April/early 
May – to be confirmed once we have an 
idea of numbers interested as space is 
limited to about 20. Made members aware 
of the Chester Green Ale Trail in Derby 
and suggested a social based on the circuit 
of six pubs in the scheme, using either the 
Swift bus service or an ACT vehicle if 

available. Circular from HQ on 
suggestions for different pub awards to be 
considered. A CAMRA leaflet is available 
to be dropped in pubs concerning Pubs 
Campaigns for 2013. Pub reports: New 
owner of Green Man now public 
knowledge, but plans are still sketchy. 
Nag’s Head, Hulland Ward – now re-

opened after refurbishment. Coach & 
Horses – For Sale signs still up, infrequent 
opening seems to be a policy of daytime 
opening only for food sales, closes at 6pm 
because “no-one about”. White Hart 
closed indefinitely. The Ketch – patchy 
opening and still very uncertain, despite 
new regime. The Horns – outside décor  

very shabby and unloved – doesn’t fit in 
with rest of square. Dog & Partridge, 
Thorpe – delayed re-opening. Station 
Hotel – although closed to public for bar 
sales, the lease is for sale. A  new owner 
may want to return to open sales and real 
ale? Information not discussed at meeting, 
but in public domain – the regime at the 
George & Dragon may be coming to an 

end. It was agreed by all that almost all of 
the above does not paint a very rosy 
picture of pub life in the town at the 
moment. Hopefully, the spring/summer 
will see an upturn in the fortunes of many 
of the pubs discussed. Pub of the Year 

Presentations. Framed certificates were 
presented by the Chairman to Andrew 

(The Cock, Clifton) and to Dave & 
Michelle (The Smith’s Tavern) for their 
achievements in the competition. AOB 

Tony Beech reported that he is perennially 
unable to speak to Heywood (Callow Top) 
brewery and obtaining up to date 
information is almost impossible. Beer 

festival –Marston’s were confirmed as 

having NO involvement despite months of 
repeated contacts and promises to return 
calls/e-mails. Dave had therefore ordered 
the glasses, which will feature just our 
festival logo and the CAMRA tankard. 
The beer order had been confirmed with 
Duke’s Ales, as well as the 3 independent 
suppliers. Still an issue with cooling – 

Dave discussing with Paul Duke and a 
potential supplier from Peakstones Ales, 
and David Coackley also suggested 

another name that we could approach. 
Music bill almost finalised as Mick Doyle 
had agreed to take a slot for a reduced fee 
– although still more than originally 
agreed. Catering requirements can be met 
as specified – the question of a fridge is 
still to be addressed, although it is believed 

that existing kitchen on site may cover all 
needs.  Meeting closed at 9.25pm. 

 

Ashbourne Diary 
MARCH 

Tues 5th – Beer festival meeting, Smith’s 
Tavern-8pm. 

Fri 22
nd

 to Sun 24
th

 - ASHBOURNE 
BEER FESTIVAL, Town Hall. 

Tues 26
th

 – BRANCH MEETING, 
Smith’s Tavern, Ashbourne-8pm. 

APRIL 
Tues 30

th
 – AGM, Shire Horse, Wyaston-

8pm. 
 

Ashbourne Contact 
Chairman, Mark Grist m.grist2@sky.com 

Amber Valley Diary 
MARCH 

Sat 16th – Free bus survey trip, to 
Codnor and Riddings, 730pm from Ripley 
Market Place.  
Mon 18th – Beer festival meeting, 
Grapes, High Street, Belper-8pm.  

Thu 28th – BRANCH MEETING, 
Barnes Wallis, Maple Avenue, Ripley –
8pm. This will be preceeded by a 

committee meeting. 

For all Amber Valley Socials contact 

Jane Wallis on 01773 745966 
 

Amber Valley Contact 
Chairman: Chris Rogers  01332 880041 

Derby Branch Diary 
MARCH 

Mon 4
th

 – Committee meeting, 
Flowerpot-8pm. 
Wed 6

th
 – City Charter Festival planning 

meeting, Exeter Arms-8pm 

Sat 9
th

 – Dance England Rapper 
Tournament, noon, Devonshire Arms, 
Station Street, Burton, prior to visiting 
other pubs. 

Wed 13
th

 – BRANCH MEETING, 
Pattenmakers Arms, Crown Street, 
Duffield-8pm. Meet at bay 22, Derby bus 
station 730pm to take advantage of Group 
Zig Zag ticket on 6.3 735pm departure. 

Thu 14
th

 to Sat 16th – Burton CAMRA 
beer festival, Town Hall. 

Tues 19
th

 – Winter festival review 

meeting, Brunswick function room 
(upstairs)-8pm. 

Tues 26
th

 – Farewell Presentation 
Social, Brunswick, 9pm. 

APRIL 
Tues 2nd – Country Pub of the Year 
presentation, Royal Oak, Ockbrook-9pm.  
16 seater bus departs Cathedral Green at 
8pm with some surveying of pubs before 

presentation. Names to Dean Smith 
07703458623. 
Wed 3

rd
 – City Charter Festival planning 

meeting, Dolphin-8pm. 
Mon 8

th
 – Committee meeting venue tba. 

Thu 11
th

 – AGM, Flowerpot, Derby-8pm. 

Tues 16
th

 – Pub of the Year 

presentation, Exeter Arms, Derby-9pm. 

Fri 26
th

 – Post winter festival brewery 
evening. Festival volunteers meet at the 
New Zealand Arms, Peel Street prior to 
brewery tour of Dancing Duck. 

For all Derby Socials contact 

Socials@derbycamra.org.uk 
 

Derby Contacts 
DERBY - Ian Forman on 01332 882996  
DERBY COMMITTEE 

committee@derbycamra.org.uk 
Chairman: Gareth Stead 

Chairman@derbycamra.org.uk  

Secretary: Ian Forman  
Secretary@derbycamra.org.uk  
Treasurer: Julian Tubbs  
Treasurer@derbycamra.org.uk  
Membership: Konrad Machej  
Membership@derbycamra.org.uk  
Pubs Officer: Steve Crispin  
pubsofficer@derbycamra.org.uk  

Committee Member: Ralf Edge  
Ralf.edge@ralfedge.co.uk 

Committee Member: Anna Dyson  

Ralf.edge@ralfedge.co.uk 

 

NON COMMITTEE 
Socials: Dean Smith  
Socials@derbycamra.org.uk  

Derby Drinker Distribution: Joy 

Olivent dds@derbycamra.org.uk  

Beer Surveys: Stewart Marshall 

beersurvey@derbycamra.org.uk 

Survey Trips: Dean Smith 

surveytrips@derbycamra.org.uk 

 
M+B Copy Deadline 

Copy to mildbitter@derbycamra.org.uk 
by Friday, 22nd March, please. 

 

 

M&B- PLEASE NOTE 
Please tell me if you: 
 

 Don’t want to get M&B 

 Don’t want other stuff from Derby 

CAMRA 

 Expected M&B but it did not arrive 

 Change your email or postal address 
 

Also tell HQ if you change address.  The 
M&B database is kept on my home PC 
and is entirely separate from the CAMRA 
membership database. 

Tim Williams, 01332 381358 

MBdatabase@derbycamra.org.uk 
 

 

 

       

Mild & Bitter – (C) 2013 – Derby, Ashbourne & Amber Valley CAMRA 

EDITOR: Paul Gibson - E-MAIL: mildbitter@derbycamra.org.uk 

We do our best to ensure that the information in M&B is accurate but no responsibility can be accepted for errors or 

omissions. Opinions expressed herein are not necessarily those of the Editor, nor of the Campaign For Real Ale Ltd.. 
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